
management should include good coordination of care
with Family medicine, Transplant/nephrology team and
social services for efficacious and successful manage-
ment of patient.
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ABSTRACT: Introduction: In the 12-week ARM-TD and
AIM-TD studies, deutetrabenazine showed clinically
significant improvements in Abnormal Involuntary
Movement Scale (AIMS) scores at Week 12 compared
with placebo, and was generally well tolerated.

OBJECTIVE: To evaluate the long-term safety/tolerability
and efficacy of deutetrabenazine in patients with TD.
Week 54 open-labelresults are reported in this interim
analysis.

METHODS: Patients with TD who completed ARM-TD or
AIM-TD were included in this open-label, single-arm
extension study, in which all patients restarted/started
deutetrabenazine 12 mg/day, titrating up to a maximum
total daily dose of 48 mg/day based on dyskinesia control
and tolerability. The study comprised a 6-week titration
period and a long-term maintenance phase. Safetymea-
sures included incidence of adverse events (AEs), serious

AEs (SAEs), drug-related AEs, and AEs leading to
withdrawal, dose reduction, or dose suspension. This
analysis reports results up to Week 54.

RESULTS: 304 patients enrolled in the extension study.
There were 215 patient-years of exposure in this analysis,
and exposure-adjusted incidence rates (EAIRs) of AEs
(incidence/patient-years) were comparable to or lower
than those observed with short-term deutetrabenazine
treatment and placebo. The frequency of SAEs (EAIR
0.14) was similar to rates observed with short-
termplacebo (EAIR 0.33) and deutetrabenazine (EAIR
range 0.06–0.33) treatment. AEs leading to study
discontinuation (EAIR 0.08), dose reduction (EAIR 0.17),
and dose suspension (EAIR 0.09) were uncommon.

CONCLUSIONS: Long-term treatment with deutetrabena-
zine was generally safe and well tolerated in patients with
TD, and did not result in cumulative toxicity.

Presented at: The American Psychiatric Association 2017
Annual Meeting; May 20–24, 2017; San Diego,
California, USA.
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ABSTRACT: Title: Optimizing TMS treatment for Depres-
sion - The 19 Minute Dash™ protocol

OBJECTIVE: NeuroStar transcranial magnetic stimulation
(TMS) is an effective treatment for patients with major
depressive disorder. Due to the treatment session
duration, a reduced treatment time would promote
patients’ comfort and convenience. Also, shorter treat-
ment sessions of retained efficacy and safety would
increase access to treatment. This reduction could be
accomplished by decreasing the time between TMS pulse
sequences, the intertrain interval (ITI).

METHODS: Meta-analysis of TMS delivered using varying
treatment parameters, particularly the ratio of train
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