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Brief reports should cite a maximum of 10references.

â€˜¿�Personalcommunications' need written authoris
ation. No other citation of unpublished work is
permissible.
Terms or abbreviations which might not be under
stood by the averagereader should beexplained at first
occurrence.

Each table should be on a separate sheet, with an
adequate heading; table and heading should be self
explanatorywithout referenceto thetext.All tablesand
figures must becited in the text. Figures should be mdi
vidual glossy photographs, or other camera-ready
prints, no: photocopies, clearly numbered and cap
tioned below. Avoid cluttering figures with explanatory
text which is better incorporatedsuccinctlyin the cap
tion. Lettering (ifim-set or stencil) should be parallel to
the axes.Units must be clearly indicated and should be
presentedin the form quantity:unit (noteâ€”'litre'should
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Proofs

A proof will be sentto thecorrespondingauthor of an
article. Offprints, which arepreparedat the sametime as
the Journal, should be ordered when the proof is
returned to the Editor. Offprints are despatched up to
six weeks after publication. The form assigning copy
right to the College must be returned with the proof.

Letters to the Editor

Letters should not exceed two double-spaced typed
pages.They will be edited for clarity and conformity
with Journalstyleand may be shortened.There should
be no more than five references; tables and figures
cannot be used. Proofs willnot be sent to authors.
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