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Notes for Contributors

Contributions. Contributions written in English are wel-
comed from all countries. Articles should be sent to:

Albert Valdman, Editor
Studies in Second Language Acquisition
1105E. Atwater
Indiana University
Bloomington, IN 47405, U.S.A.

Manuscript submissions. SSLA welcomes unsolicited
articles, including replication studies. State of the Art
articles, review articles, articles in thematic issues, re-
sponses, and book reviews are commissioned by the edi-
tors.

Manuscripts should not have been published pre-
viously or be under consideration for publication else-
where in any form. In addition, SSLA will consider only
one submission per author per volume. Manuscripts un-
dergo a two-tier evaluation process. First, they are read
by an in-house committee. If topic and scope are deemed
appropriate, they are then sent out for blind review to at
least three readers selected from the Editorial Board,
Avisory Committee, and other experts in the field. The
names of all readers consulted will be listed in the final
issue of each volume.

Between 10 and 20 percent of manuscripts submitted
are accepted for publication. Publication decision is usu-
ally made within four months of submission. Articles are
normally published within one year of acceptance.

Format SSLA requests that all submissions conform to
the requirements of the Publication Manual of the Amer-
ican Psychological Association (Fourth Edition), which
can be obtained from the American Psychological Asso-
ciation (APA), Order Department, P.O. Box 2710, Hyatt-
sville, MD 20784. It is also available in bookstores and
libraries.

All manuscripts should be submitted in four copies. No
materials will be returned to authors. Contributors
should keep a copy of the manuscript, as the original will
not be included with the page proofs. All submissions
must be double-spaced on standard-size paper.

Title page and abstract A separate double-spaced title
page should be provided, including the following infor-
mation: title, subtitle, all authors' names and affiliations,
and the lead author's address, telephone number, and
e-mail address (if applicable). These items should each
be entered on a separate line, using normal capitaliza-
tion and no underlining. Each paper must begin with a
100-150 word abstract.

Tables, figures, and illustrations. Authors are respon-
sible for providing camera-ready copy of tables, figures,
and illustrations with the submission of an article.

References. Sources cited or referred to in the text
should indicate the author's surname, publication date,
and page number(s) when pertinent: (Gass, 1994; Light-
bown & Spada, 1994, p. 563); if more than one, citations
should appear in alphabetical order. When the author's
name is part of the text, follow this form: Schumann
(1994) argues t h a t . . . .

All in-text citations must be listed in full in the refer-
ence list at the end of each article, following the specifi-
cations of the APA manual. Begin the reference list on a
separate page entitled "References" and double-space it
throughout. Each entry must include the author's name,
co-authors (if any), publication date, and title of work.
For a journal article, also provide the name of the jour-
nal, volume number, and page numbers for the article.
For an article in an edited volume, list the editor's name,
title of the collection, and page numbers of the article.
For a book or monograph, list the edition, volume num-
ber, series, place of publication, and name of publisher.
Punctuate and capitalize as in the following examples:

Eckman, F. R. (1993, April). Local and long-distance
anaphora in second language acquisition. Paper
presented at the American Association of Applied
Linguistics Annual Conference, Atlanta.

Ellis, R. (1994). The study of second language acquisi-
tion. Oxford: Oxford University Press.

Lakshmanan, U. (1989). Accessibility to Universal
Grammar in child second language acquisition. Un-
published Ph.D. dissertation, University of Michi-
gan, Ann Arbor.

Meisel, J. (Ed.). (1994). Bilingual first language acquisi-
tion: French and German grammatical develop-
ment. Amsterdam: Benjamins.

Trahey, M., & White, L. (1993). Positive evidence and
preemption in the second language classroom.
Studies in Second Language Acquisition, 15, 181-
201.

Zuengler, J. (1993). Explaining NNS interactional be-
havior: The effect of conversational topic. In G.
Kasper & S. Blum-Kulka (Eds.), Interlanguageprag-
matics (pp. 184-195). New York: Oxford University
Press.

Book reviews. Inquiries regarding book reviews (500-
750 words) and notices (350 words) should be directed
to: Susan Gass, Associate Editor, SSLA. English Language
Center, 1 CIP, Michigan State University, East Lansing,
MI 48824.

Proofs. First proof of an article or review article will be
sent to the lead author (or a nominee), who will be ex-
pected to correct and return it to the Editor, via airmail
when appropriate, within three days of receipt.

Offprints. 25 offprints will be provided free of charge to
the lead author of an article or review article. Additional
offprints may be purchased only if ordered at proof
stage.

Copyright Contributors of accepted articles will be
asked to assign their copyrights on certain conditions to
Cambridge University Press to help protect their mate-
rial, particularly in the U.S.A.
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