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More than 70 independent plastics experts from the Scientists’ Coalition for an Effective Plastics 
Treaty (‘The Scientists’ Coalition’) attended what was expected to be the final negotiating session 
(INC5) of the global plastics treaty in Busan, Republic of Korea, from 25 November - 1 December 
2024. While a treaty was not agreed, the meeting in Busan catalysed a surge of momentum 
among nations seeking an ambitious outcome. This was most palpable at a press conference 
held by the newly established ‘Coalition of the Willing’ on the second to last day comprising more 
than 100 countries led by Rwanda, Panama, Mexico, France, Fiji, and the European Union. At 
the press conference, the ‘Coalition of the Willing’ mobilised and laid down their red lines, refusing 
to agree to anything less than a binding treaty that would address the full life cycle of plastics, 
including production reduction targets. Regardless of the efforts of high ambition countries, 
consensus was not realized due to push-back from major fossil fuel and petrochemical producing 
countries.  

From an evidence-based perspective, we maintain that an effective treaty that is successful in 
fulfilling the mandate outlined in United Nations Environment Assembly Resolution 5/14 will 
require binding obligations to reduce production, as indicated by numerous scientific publications 
and reports (e.g. Baztan et al 2024, Bergmann et al 2022, Brander et al 2024, OECD 2024, Simon 
et al 2021, Villarrubia-Gómez et al 2024, Walker et al 2023). The urgency for action is underscored 
by evidence that links increasing  plastics production with climate change, biodiversity loss, and 
human rights violations (Schmidt et al 2024; Lavers, Bond, & Rolsky 2022; MacLeod et al 2024; 
Stoett et al 2024; Varvastian 2024).The Scientists’ Coalition, along with observers from over 440 
organisations attending INC5, had little opportunity to enter negotiating spaces in contact groups, 
where specific topic areas, such as those related to plastics products, chemicals of concern, and 
financial support for systemic change, were negotiated. In addition, much of the negotiations 
occurred in ‘informals’ where observer access was denied and there were scant opportunities for 
observer statements in plenaries where all delegates were present. We note that these decisions, 
indicate efforts to move negotiations forward in a timely manner. However, they also bring into 
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question the democratic legitimacy of the process as they could be seen as a departure from the 
norms and practices established in United Nations multilateral agreements designed to include 
all relevant representatives and experts including scientists, Indigenous peoples, and non-
government organisations (UNEP & UNNGLS 2020). 

The ‘compilation text’ (draft treaty text) produced at INC4, Ottawa, April 2024 was a 70-page 
bloated version of the previous zero draft treaty text and full of square brackets (indicating lacking 
agreement). To focus and facilitate future negotiations, the Chair released the first two of five 
synthesised versions of the compilation text in the period between INC4 and INC5 (the 
intersessional period). The final version, released on the final day of negotiations in Busan, is 
known as ‘the Chair’s text’. 

During the week in Busan, our scientists focused their time and expertise analysing conference 
room papers from groups of aligned countries and the Chair’s updated non-papers/text and 
rapidly sending evidence-based responses to member states including Spanish and French 
translations to increase accessibility. 

Three Articles of the Chair’s text particularly lacks agreement among member states: Article 3 
‘Plastic Products’; Article 6 ‘[Supply] [Sustainable Production]’; and Article 11 [Financial 
[Resources and] Mechanism. Controls will be needed for all three articles to effectively end 
pollution across the full life plastics cycle, significantly reduce use of plastic chemicals 
demonstrated to harm health and the environment, and provide the proper financial support to 
ensure a just transition  

For Article 3, the Scientists’ Coalition recommends binding obligations based on globally 
harmonised criteria as well as initial and broadly inclusive lists of hazardous plastic chemicals and 
products of concern in an annex of the treaty as suggested in the Mexico / Switzerland conference 
room paper. The establishment of a dedicated science body free of conflicts of interest will be 
essential to the success of the treaty. A key role of the science body will be to add new products 
and chemicals of concern to those lists over time.  

There is an option for no text (that is, to delete the article) in Article 6 along with a second option 
detailing obligations to reduce production. Based on robust evidence, it is the position of the 
Scientists’ Coalition that, if there is no article to control the supply of plastics there will be 
insufficient plastic production regulations, and the treaty will be largely ineffective.  

Plastic pollution represents one of the world’s most intractable socio-environmental challenges 
which disproportionately impacts vulnerable communities, particularly those in small island 
developing states (SIDS) and other low-income countries. These countries must have equitable 
access to the financial support needed to protect themselves from further plastic pollution and to 
mitigate the harms of existing plastic pollution. Therefore, it is the view of the authors that text 
regarding a new dedicated independent multilateral financial mechanism be included in Article 
11. The new financial mechanism would need to give the Conference of Parties the mandate to 
ensure just and fair distribution of funds to countries most in need to support the implementation 
of the treaty across the full life cycle of plastics. Contributions to the fund should include relevant 
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public and private sectors across the full life cycle of plastics including those operating at 
extraction and production phases.  

Successful agreement to a global plastics treaty represents a once-in-a-lifetime opportunity to 
address the global plastics crisis. The venue and date for INC 5.2 is yet to be confirmed, but the 
Scientists’ Coalition will continue to provide independent evidence to enable fully informed 
negotiations to negotiators in the run up to, and during, the next phase of negotiations. Depending 
on our ability to secure funding from sources free of conflicts of interest, the Scientists’ Coalition 
will also provide ongoing support in the treaty implementation phase.  
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